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Product Title

Introducing the all-new 559-08442-JVT
CPU BOARD – a seamless replacement
for the hard-to-find 1005146 CPU
BOARD, A2 366MHz Celeron with
128MB memory. No more struggling to
source alternatives; our innovative CPU
board is designed to effortlessly replace
the original without the need for any
alterations.

•Processor: A2 300MHz Celeron
•Memory: 512 MB RAM
•Storage: Compactflash hard drive
•Operating System: QNX 2.21

Experience a smooth transition with our
CPU board, delivering performance on
par with the older model. Enjoy the same
reliability and efficiency without the need
for modifications.

Optimize your system with 512 MB RAM,
ensuring efficient operation and a
smooth computing experience.

Upgrade effortlessly with plug-and-play
design, maintaining the same size for
installation. No need for modifications.
our CPU board seamlessly replaces the
old for a swift and hassle-free upgrade.

Rest easy with our CPU board sourced
directly from our manufacturer, adhering
to the same high standards as the
original for reliability you can trust.

Details

● Plug and Play installation

 ● Very reliable up-grade

 ● Installation procedure available

 ● Installation on-site available

 ● Technical support available

 ● Proven reliable at many customer sites

 ● Continuous support

 ● More Ram Memory

 ● Operating System Pre-installed

Benefits
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